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Amendment 71 to read as follows:

(6) Following the adoption of the joint 
programmes, the Commission shall conclude 
a financing agreement with the participating 
countries in accordance with the relevant 
provisions of Regulation (EC, Euratom) No 
1605/2002 of 25 June 2002, the Financial 
Regulation applicable to the general budget 
of the European Communities.

6. Following the adoption of the joint 
operational programmes, the Commission 
shall conclude a financing agreement with 
the participating countries in accordance 
with the relevant provisions of Regulation 
(EC, Euratom) No 1605/2002 of 25 June 
2002 on the Financial Regulation applicable 
to the general budget of the European 
Communities. The financing agreement 
will include the legal provisions that are 
necessary for the implementation of the 
joint operational programme and should 
also be signed by the Joint Managing 
Authority referred to in Article 10.

(Concerns all languages.)


