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SHORT JUSTIFICATION

After 8 years of negotiations between the European Commission and Pakistan, agreement was 
finally reached on a re-admission procedure for persons residing without authorization, and 
the agreed text was signed in October 2009, subject to its conclusion. With the coming into 
force of the Lisbon Treaty, the European Parliament will have to give its consent to the 
proposed agreement; if Parliament votes to reject the agreement, it cannot come into force. 
The Committee on Civil Liberties, Justice and Home Affairs (LIBE) is the lead committee 
and, given the long-standing interest in Pakistan of the Committee on Foreign Affairs, AFET 
requested authorisation to draft an opinion.

The proposed decision concerning the conclusion of the agreement sets out the necessary 
internal arrangements for the practical application of the Agreement. In the Explanatory 
Memorandum attached to the proposal, the Commission points out that the readmission 
obligations are drawn up in a fully reciprocal way, comprising own nationals as well as third-
country nationals and stateless persons. A derogation for Denmark and, latterly, Ireland, from 
the decision, has been agreed.

The original draft opinion had called on the Committee on Civil Liberties, Justice and Home 
Affairs, as the committee responsible, to reject the proposal, pointing to the unstable internal 
situation and the persistent pattern of human rights violations in Pakistan, the absence by the 
Commission in its negotiations of attempts to ensure that the rights and safety of returnees 
(both Pakistanis and third country or stateless persons in transit to the final state of 
destination) would be respected, as hardly reassuring in the context of compulsory 
readmissions to Pakistan. Also cited as disturbing was the fact that no evaluation has yet been 
made of the 11 re-admission agreements already in forced, particularly in the light of concerns 
about respect for human rights.

Members agreed that these were indeed significant concerns but decided that a clear 
framework for co-operation on readmission with Pakistan was preferable to a situation where 
there is a risk that Member States proceed to return illegal immigrants on an ad hoc basis and 
without EU supervision regarding respect for the human rights of returnees, whether of 
Pakistani origin or third country or stateless people in transit through Pakistan. Article 16 of 
the Readmission agreement would ensure that the EU had a say in this respect. The 
Committee reiterated the need for an evaluation of the agreements concluded thus far by the 
EU but took the view that these general considerations should not lead to the rejection of this 
particular agreement. 

*******

The Committee on Foreign Affairs calls on the Committee on Civil Liberties, Justice and 
Home Affairs, as the committee responsible, to propose that Parliament give its consent. 
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