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Amendment 1
Emil Radev

Draft opinion
Paragraph 2

Draft opinion Amendment

2. Highlights the recommendations 
made by the European Parliament in its 
resolution of 10 May 2023 to amend the 
Implementing Measures for the Members’ 
Statute (IMMS), aimed at increasing 
transparency, accountability and sound 
financial management of funds made 
available to Members, bearing also in mind 
the principle of the independence of the 
parliamentary mandate and the importance 
to avoid creating unnecessary 
administrative burdens for Parliament, its 
Members and their offices;

2. Welcomes the creation of a 
Bureau ad-hoc Working Group to carry 
out a thorough overhaul of the 
Implementing Measures for the Statute for 
Members of the European Parliament 
(IMMS) while striking a balance between 
the freedom of the exercise of the 
mandate, the reputational risks to 
Parliament and managerial ethics, 
following the announcement by the 
President on 21 November 2022; 
highlights that the amendment of the 
IMMS is aimed at increasing transparency, 
accountability and sound financial 
management of funds made available to 
Members, bearing also in mind the 
principle of the independence of the 
parliamentary mandate and the importance 
to avoid creating unnecessary 
administrative burdens for Parliament, its 
Members and their offices;

Or. en

Amendment 2
Emil Radev

Draft opinion
Paragraph 3

Draft opinion Amendment

3. Is concerned that the actuarial 
deficit of the Voluntary Pension Fund 
(VPF) on 31 December 2021 amounted to 
EUR 379 million (compared to EUR 371,3 
million on 31 December 2020) and 
concurs with the Parliament’s call in its 
resolution of 10 May 2023 to adjust the 

3. Notes that the actuarial deficit of 
the Voluntary Pension Fund (VPF) on 31 
December 2021 amounted to EUR 379 
million (compared to EUR 371,4 million 
on 31 December 2020); Welcomes the 
amendments made by the Parliament’s 
Bureau to Article 76 of the IMMS in 
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modalities of the fund; relation to the Additional (Voluntary) 
Pension Scheme, which entered into force 
on 1 July 2023, and which aim at 
reducing future pension obligations from 
EUR 362.7 million to estimated EUR 139 
million, and the actuarial deficit of the 
Fund from EUR 310 million to estimated 
EUR 86 million;

Or. en

Amendment 3
Emil Radev

Draft opinion
Paragraph 4

Draft opinion Amendment

4. Welcomes the amendments made 
by the Parliament’s Bureau to Article 76 
of the IMMS in relation to the Additional 
(Voluntary) Pension Scheme, which 
entered into force on 1 July 2023, and 
which aim at reducing future pension 
obligations from EUR 362.7 million to 
estimated EUR 139 million, and the 
actuarial deficit of the Fund from EUR 
310 million to estimated EUR 86 million;
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