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EUROPEAN PARLIAMENT
DELEGATION FOR RELATIONS WITH THE PEOPLE'S REPUBLIC OF CHINA

22ND INTERPARLIAMENTARY MEETING EP/CHINA

Brussels 11 October 2005

First Working Session: Economic and Social Issues

Theme 1: Trade 

 * EU-China textile trade
 * Bilateral trade relations and opening of the Chinese market
 * Negotiations within the framework of the WTO

Mr STERCKX, Chair of the European Parliament delegation for relations with China, opened 
the 22nd European Parliament-National People's Congress Interparliamentary Meeting (IPM) at 
9.35 hrs. 

He welcomed the guests and stressed the increasing significance of China in world affairs and 
the importance of EU-China commercial and political ties. He noted that in 2004 EU-China trade 
relations were worth 175 billion euros. He underlined that the EU was looking forward to the 
development of the strategic partnership, especially in the fields of trade, monetary policy, 
climate change, environment and development. Mr STERCKX emphasised that, although the EU 
and China still had different views on human rights issues, there had been some progress in this 
area. 

Mr WANG, Chair of the Chinese delegation, thanked Mr STERCKX for his welcome and 
echoed his sentiments. He also underlined the importance of strengthening bilateral links and the 
need for a frank and open exchange of views. 

Mr CALABUIG RULL also welcomed the increasing bilateral trade, however he drew attention 
to some areas of concern such as the textile trade, difficulties with entering the Chinese market, 
and problems with implementing intellectual property rights. Mr CALABUIG RULL also drew 
attention to the areas of Chinese markets that were attractive for European businesses such as the 
energy and financial sectors. He also stressed the importance of introducing the principle of 
reciprocity in bilateral relations.

Mr HE KENG pointed to China's comparative advantage in labour-intensive products, while 
Europe was more advanced in technology intensive goods. He agreed that barriers to trade were 
a negative phenomenon and could be incompatible with WTO standards. 
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Mr HOPPENSTEDT stated that the sharp increase in textile imports from China threatened over 
one million jobs in the EU. He pointed to the examples of non-respect of intellectual property
rights in China and ineffective piracy prevention measures being taken by the Chinese 
government. The Chinese government was currently pursuing over 9000 court cases, he said, 
but there were no effective sanctions. 

Mr ZHANG outlined the new legislation being introduced in China to protect intellectual 
property rights. He also stressed that non-respect of intellectual property rights was often the 
result of simple ignorance on the part of Chinese businessmen and he recognised that the process 
might take some time. 

Mr DEHAENE emphasised that importance of bilateral trade, Europe's trade deficit with China;
problems with unrestricted access to markets; and a general lack of transparency for the 'rules of 
the game'. He called for further integration of China into the world economy to create a 'win-win' 
situation. 

Mr HE KENG explained that the EU's trade deficit resulted from the competitive advantage of 
Chinese goods and a growing demand for them in Europe, while European goods were still 
expensive for Chinese consumers. He confirmed that China was observing its WTO obligations 
on tariffs and opening up of the insurance and financial sectors. He underlined that rules on 
transparency in China were set up according to international standards. 

Mr WANG confirmed that China was committed to the further development of bilateral, political 
and economic ties, despite some problems with Beijing's trade relations with certain Member 
States. Mr BUSHILL-MATTHEWS asked whether Chinese car manufacturers were planning to 
install their production units in Europe's traditional regions of heavy industry, such as the West 
Midlands of the United Kingdom. Mr WANG replied that Chinese industrialists tended to 
undertake production locally as labour costs were cheaper. Moreover, Chinese companies had 
faced several problems when seeking to invest abroad, partly due to their lack of knowledge of 
local legislation.

Mrs BATZELI called for a more extended social framework for bilateral relations. She 
mentioned that China did not fully respect its WTO entry commitments on liberalisation of its 
ship-building industry. She also expressed concerns over genetically modified foods produced in 
China. Mr HE KENG agreed that there was a need for a government or international framework 
of regulation on issues such as genetically modified foods. He also confirmed that Beijing would 
honour China's WTO accession treaty timetable with respect to financial markets. He also 
emphasised China's attempts to reduce bureaucratic procedures in this area. In addition, he 
referred to the competition faced by traditional ship-building countries in Europe, as the Chinese 
labour force was much cheaper.

Mr ZHANG commented on recent legal developments in China, including the adoption of the 
Administrative Procedure Law which simplified licensing procedures. Mr WANG proposed that 
Mrs BATZELI should address her concerns on ship-building in writing to the competent experts 
in Beijing. 

Mr ROUCEK mentioned the benefits free trade had brought to Skoda which was now building a 
car factory in Shanghai. Mr HE KENG referred again to the problems of market access of 
Chinese textiles to the EU market. Mr WANG emphasised that Beijing was respecting its WTO 
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entry obligations and that China was adapting to the new political and economical realities. The 
EU should also come to terms with the rise of China and India as new economic and political 
powers. 

Mr BATZELI asked about the welfare system in China. Mr WANG agreed that a wide wealth 
gap existed in the country. He noted that President HU JIN TAO had put this issue as a top 
priority for the 11th Chinese Five-year Economic Plan. Mr HE KENG updated members about 
the progress made by the Chinese government in fighting unemployment and referred to the re-
employment programme which every year brought back four to five million people into the 
labour market. Mr STERCKX proposed that China could adapt some elements from the 
European welfare system. 

Theme 2: Environment, climate change, sustainable development

 * Urban and sustainable development
 * Energy and research
 * Multipolar world

Mr TURMES raised energy and environmental issues in connection with sustainable 
development. He stressed the challenges of developing an economic system for 1.3 billion 
people without destroying the environment. He called on China to conduct a peaceful foreign 
policy and to follow the European path in energy efficiency technologies as China's fast growing 
industry was pushing up international oil prices. 

Mr WATSON wished to discuss urban development models and sustainable development issues 
in China. He pointed to the increase in Chinese dependent on energy imports and asked about 
developments in the area of renewable energy in China. He also called for the creation of a new 
ethical framework on biological and medical research. 

Mrs AYALA SENDER mentioned the 'open door' and mobility policy in connection with 
international tourism. She expressed her worries about the damage to the environment caused by 
an ever- expanding transportation infrastructure and stressed the need for a transportation system 
China that caused less pollution. She also addressed the issue of sustainable tourism both in 
China and the EU and underlined the importance for solidarity between regions in China. Mrs 
AYALA SENDER drew attention as well to the need to protect the cultural heritage and the 
natural landscape and the importance of relations between rural and urban areas in China. 
Finally, she asked about China's view on regional security problems. 

Mr HE KENG confirmed China's commitment to energy efficiency policies, including the use of 
renewable and fewer fossil fuels. He outlined the particular nature of China's model of 
urbanisation and the work being done to adjust regional inequalities. Mr ZHANG spoke about 
the internal migration issue and stressed the financial transfers being made from big cities to 
rural areas. Mr HE KENG recognised the importance of an effective transport infrastructure for 
Chinese economic development and referred to joint EU-China transportation projects. Mr 
WANG referred to energy security and underlined the importance of coal to China. He rejected 
charges that China was responsible for higher world oil prices and pointed to the substantial 
increase in China's energy efficiency. Finally he stressed his support for the UN Security Council 
reform and underlined the need for the United Nations to play an enhanced role in world affairs. 
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Lisbon Strategy - REACH directive

Mrs OOMEN-RUIJTEN outlined the main goals of the REACH directive and the Lisbon 
Strategy, referring to new legislation on standards for re-evaluation of old chemical products. 
She stressed that the new EU legislation was aimed at increasing European consumers'
confidence and that it would have repercussions for future EU trade relations. Mrs 
LAPERROUZE outlined the positive impact of the REACH directive on the EU job market and 
claimed that the adoption of REACH standards abroad was a positive trend. She called for close 
EU-China cooperation in the field of consumer health protection. Mr WANG supported this 
proposal and called for further EU-China technical cooperation. Mr HE KENG expressed 
concern over the use of REACH as an instrument for protecting markets, especially the European 
agricultural market. 

Mr HOPPENSTEDT underlined the importance of the monetary and industrial policy in EU-
China bilateral relations and referred to the issues linked to the second round of the Basle talks 
on security of loans. He suggested that EU accounting and insurance standards might be applied 
to foreign based companies if they worked with EU clients. He also referred to the deregulation 
of the Chinese state-owned shipbuilding industry and the management of China's foreign 
currency reserves. Mr HE KENG confirmed China's desire to meet its WTO and Basle 
obligations and to open up its financial market. 

Mr WANG spoke on the ship-building industry issue and called for a reform of state-owned 
enterprises. He linked the US trade and budget deficit issue with the stability of financial 
markets. Mr HE KENG confirmed that China was not interested in increasing its trade surplus 
and noted China's plans to diversify its foreign currency reserves. 

Mr STERCKX thanked the speakers and closed the first part of the meeting at 12.30 hrs. 

***

Second Working Session: Political and Security Issues

 * EU-China relations
 * Tourism and the 2008 Olympic Games
* Human rights including the situation for ethnic minorities, Tibet and China-Taiwan relations
* Global security issues

Mr STERCKX opened the second part of the meeting at 15.00 hrs and raised a number of 
questions, including China-Taiwan relations; internal political developments in China such as 
human rights issues and the position of ethnic minorities; and EU-China cooperation on the 
international arena. He underlined the need for more frequent meetings between the European 
Parliament and the Chinese National People's Congress and noted that 100 people in the 
European Commission were working on China-related matters. Mr WANG criticised a number 
of EP resolutions on China and called for a true strategic partnership and a bilateral dialogue. Mr 
BELDER noted that he was the rapporteur on China and asked about China's regional policy. 
Mrs TRÜPEL mentioned that there were substantial political differences between the EU and 
China and proposed that cooperation should be concentrated on specific areas. She called for 
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more mutual understanding. Mrs HENNICOT-SCHOEPGES called for more intensive student 
exchanges between the EU and China. 

In answer to a question from Mrs CORBEY about what the Chinese considered to be 
unacceptable in the EU society, Mr WANG mentioned some differences between the EU and 
China and called for a constructive cooperation. He outlined China's interest in economic and 
political stability in Central Asia and called for the creation of a free trade area with ASEAN 
countries. He also stressed that economic and political cooperation between China and Japan was 
a cornerstone of regional security. He recognised the importance of issues in relation to the 
readmission treaty negotiations and the fight against international terrorism.

Mr ZHANG mentioned the interest of Chinese students in receiving technically-oriented degrees 
from foreign universities. He expressed his concerns over the European arms embargo and the 
European Parliament attempts to internationalise the questions of Tibet and Taiwan. 

Mr MAVROMMATIS congratulated China on hosting the 2008 Olympic Games and called for 
more intensive EU-China cooperation in the fields of tourism and sport. Mrs CORBEY raised 
the issue of pollution and the need for measures to be taken to improve the air quality in Beijing. 
This would have particular implications for the marathon event, she thought. Mr ZHANG 
referred to environmental problems and gave details of some anti-pollution measures taken by 
the Chinese government. Mr WANG noted that up to 1.5 % of China's GDP would be spent 
annually in order to improve environmental standards. He called for a partnership and sharing of 
environment related technology. 

Mrs DOYLE raised the issue of the economic impact of the Olympic Games and the possible 
removal of 'undesirable' individuals from Beijing during the Games. She was also concerned 
about the welfare of horses at the equestrian events in Hong Kong. Mr WANG recognised that 
the Olympic Games should have a positive effect on tourism, although he was uncertain whether
the Games would be of direct economic benefit to China.

Mrs GEBHARDT welcomed the inclusion of the concept of human rights into China's 
constitution, however she felt that the changes had only taken place on paper. Nevertheless she 
mentioned a number of cases of serious human rights violations and called for an improvement 
of China's human rights record. She drew particular attention to the freedom of the internet and 
the continuation of capital punishment. She also expressed concern at a hospital she had visited 
in Tibet which had no running water. Mr PIKS linked the human rights issue in China with the 
improvement of standards of living and called for economic and cultural support to ethnic 
minorities. He referred to the positive economic effects in the autonomous regions and the 
massive investment from China's central government. He also underlined the need for religious 
Tibetans and the Chinese government to be reconciled. He believed that the regional authorities 
were more careless for human rights. Mr TABAJDI pointed to the Chinese diasporas in the EU 
and called for the further integration of the Chinese minorities into European society noting that 
there were some 100 million members of national minorities within China itself, he also asked 
about quotas for national minorities in regional administrations in China. Finally, he drew 
attention to the problems faced by lesbian women and gay men in China. 

Mr WATSON spoke of the links between his political group and Taiwan and called on Beijing to 
stop using threats of military force against Taipei. He underlined the principle of self-
determination as a principle means of resolving this conflict. Mr ZHANG mentioned debates on 
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personal data protection as an example of growing political pluralism in China. He recognised 
that there were problems with human rights and national minorities but pointed to the progress 
achieved, specially at the regional level. Mr WANG stated that China was not currently in a 
position to abolish the death penalty although capital punishment was now used more cautiously. 
He claimed that ethnic minorities were well represented in China's state institutions. Mr
LOSANG noted that he was a member of the Religious Affairs Committee in Lhasa and that 
there were 600 temples in Tibet with more that 60000 Lamas. He recognised that during the 
cultural revolution many temples had been destroyed but these had been subsequently rebuilt. 
Policies were now in place to protect temples and all citizens and the freedom to pursue their 
religious beliefs. He argued that the Dalai Lama had been until 1959 the head of the groups that 
were oppressing the people in Tibet and that he had fled in that year of his own accord. He
claimed that both religious freedom and social rights were respected.

Mr WANG supported a peaceful settlement of the Taiwan issue, on condition that Taipei 
accepted the policy of 'one China'. He referred to the anti-secession law that had been passed by 
the National People's Congress and he claimed that the United Nation's resolution on self 
determination was not applicable to Taiwan.

Mrs ROURE also spoke of the problems faced by the inhabitants of Tibet and expected that the 
Commission would follow up on this issue.

Mr STERCKX stressed that there should be more links between the European Parliament and the 
National People's Congress and a request was being made that there should be two meetings 
every year. This would mean that both delegations would travel to the other place of work in a 
year for a meeting in the future. The next meeting was scheduled to take place in November 
2006 in Beijing, however he hoped that a bureau visit would be possible to China in the spring. 
He closed the session at 18.00 hrs. 

****

ANNEXE/ALLEGATO/BIJLAGE/ANEXO/BILAGA
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OF ATTENDANCE/LISTA DE ASISTENCIA/LISTE DE PRESENCE/ELENCO DEI
PRESENTI/PRESENTIELIJST/LISTA DE PRESENÇAS/LÄSNÄOLOLISTA/DELTAGARLISTA
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